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Neo-Liberal Strategies to Cut Costs in Settlement
Services: Cost Recovery and Devolution

John Morris

Abstract

The author considers the range of settle-

ment services funded by Citizenship
and Immigration Canada (CIC) tracing
the relative costs of settlement services

in both Quebec and the rest of Canada.

Government cost cutting and recovery

strategies applied to settlement services

are reviewed against an explanation of
neo-liberalist ideology as it has been
interpreted by the Federal government

(1993-1997). Some of the arguments
put forward against cost recovery are
also reviewed.

Precis

L'auteur explore l'éventail des services
d'intégration mis en place par Citoyen-

neté et Immigration Canada (CIC) en
retraçant les coûts relatifs des services

d'intégration au Québec et dans le reste

du Canada. On passe en revue l'applica-
tion des stratégies de compressions et de

recouvrement budgétaires gouverne-
mentales au cas spécifique du secteur
des services d'intégration, ce qui permet

de procéder à une explication de l'inter-

prétation de l'idéologie néo-libérale à
laquelle procéda le gouvernement fédé-

ral (1993-1997). Certains des argu-
ments mis de l'avant en matière de

recouvrements de coûts sont aussi pré-
sentés.

Neo-Liberalism

The Canadian government started to
follow neo-liberal economic policies in
the mid-1980s. "Neo" preceding "lib-
eral" means a new kind of liberalism.
The old kind was the liberal school of
economics that became famous after

the publication of English economist
Adam Smith's, The Wealth of Nations in
1776. Liberal economics advocated the

John Morris, PhD, is Assistant Professor of
Geography, Nipissing University, North Bay.

abolition of government intervention
in economic matters. Free trade was

seen as the best way for a nation's
economy to develop; no restrictions on
manufacturing, no barriers to com-
merce, and no tariffs. Such ideas were
"liberal" in the sense of no controls.

When applied to individuals it encour-
aged free enterprise and free competi-
tion without limits on profits or capital
accumulation as would be argued for
by varying stripes of socialists.

Economic liberalism prevailed in
Canada and North America through
the 1800s and early 1900s. With the
Great Depression of the 1930s econo-
mist John Maynard Keynes was able to
successfully challenge liberalism as
the best policy for capitalists. He ar-
gued that full employment is neces-
sary for capitalism to grow and it can
be achieved only if governments
intervene to increase employment.
Through the post-World War II period
North American economies grew
quickly because of the age structure
and export opportunities elsewhere.
From the 1970s onward, however, with

an older age structure and increased
world competition, profits shrank in-
spiring the corporate elite to revive
economic liberalism, making it thus
new or neo-liberalism.

Four important concepts central to
neo-liberalism are the following: cut-
ting public expenditure for social serv-
ices like education and health care;
deregulation of government activities
that might diminish profits; privatis-
ing government run businesses, for
example utilities, hospitals; and elimi-
nating the concept of "the public good"
or "community" and replacing it with
"individual responsibility." These are
the concepts that are the basis for most
governmental decision-making in
Canada.
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Deficit Fighting by the Federal
Government

In the mid-1990s debt in the Federal

government has become a terrifically
serious concern. In 1996 government
debt equalled 100 percent of the coun-
try's total output; total debt is over
$550 billion. The only time in Canada's
history the ratio of debt to economic
output was as high was in 1946 at the
end of the Second World War. A con-
certed effort was made to reduce debt

to GDP until 1974 (though the period
did also see ongoing economic expan-
sion) when debt reached a low of 20
percent of GDP (Turner 1996). From
here politicians began to spend wildly,
and the rate of economic growth began
to decrease to the point where very
serious government spending cuts -
and extreme neo-liberal policies - are
now seen as the only way to bring defi-
cits and debt under control.

Canadians grudgingly support the
need to reduce the deficit in a neo-lib-

eral way. Social policies and programs
built during the Keynesian era, an era
that sought to rectify the injustices of
capitalism, are being dismantled. Poli-
cies such as universalism - that all
should receive the same fundamental

services without regard to personal
income - and equality in service - that
all should receive the same standards

of service - are being abandoned. For
those who lived through the Great
Depression and World War II these
values were deemed a sacred trust.

With an aging population, however, it
appears that the experiences of hard-
ship and values developed through
hardship are waning in popular senti-
ment. For this older population gener-
ous social policies were sacred. Times
and values, it appears, have changed.
A poll conducted at year's end in 1996
reported that a majority of Canadians
expect that within the next decade
Canada will have a two-tiered (public
and private) health care system and
private universities; two institutions
that previous generations successfully
avoided (Wilson-Smith 1997). The neo-

liberal agenda is being implemented

through the Federal budgets, the 1996
February budget is a case in point.

The Budget of 1996 as an Example
of Neo-Liberal Policy
Implementation

When arriving in office in late 1993 the
Liberal government inherited an an-
nual deficit of $42 billion from the Con-

servatives. By 1997 they expect to
shrink that operating deficit to $17 bil-
lion (Wilson-Smith 1997). Much of the
deficit reduction program was an-
nounced the previous year in the gov-
ernment's February budget of 1995.
Beyond modest budget cuts that in-
cluded a 9-percent reduction in gov-
ernment program spending by
1996-97, the Government imple-
mented and proposed tax and revenue
increases of 6.5 billion in the period
from 1994 to 1998. One and a half bil-

lion of this is coming from user fees and

cost recovery items such as the Right of
Landing Fee (ROLF) for immigrants.
The result for Canadians is that the

nature of living and doing business in
Canada is changing (Corcoran 1995).

Another dimension of the neo-lib-

eral ideology is to reduce the size of
government. In the February budget of
1996 the Government proposed the
devolution of powers to the provinces
in forestry, mining, labour market
training, and recreation. Further, it
promised to negotiate and dialogue in
other areas such as social policy pro-
gramming (e.g., child care and health
care) that had previously been a non-
negotiable Federal domain. One of the
purposes of devolution is to save the
devolving organisation money. A pat-
tern that can be identified is that in-

creased powers through devolution
also means decreased funding. For ex-
ample transfer payments to the prov-
inces for health, social services and
education have become less tied but
are also scheduled to see reductions in

funding by nearly one third or $6 bil-
lion by 1997-98 from about $18 billion
in 1995 ( Western Report 1995).

Devolution is seen by the Federal
Government as the most hands-off

kind of arrangement it can foresee in

service delivery. On a continuum of
Federal government involvement
devolution is found at one extreme. At

the other is complete government
control. In between are different
configurations of partnerships and
consultations (Rodal 1995, 13). To the
Federal government devolution
means the passing along of service
delivery, program/service design,
evaluation and adjustment to some
other party while the government re-
tains control of policy development,
standards, monitoring and oversight
(ibid.). D
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Breaking Ground:
The 1956 Hungarian

Immigration to Canada

Edited by

Robert H. Keyserlingk

Toronto: York Lanes Press, 1993

ISBN 1-55014-232-1, 117 pages, $6.99

This book is a collection of personal
and archival-based memories on
the selection, transport and settle-
ment of about 40,000 Hungarian
refugees in Canada in one year. It is
a source of primary record as well
as scholarly reflection on one of the
most significant refugee move-
ments to Canada after World War

II - the 1956 Hungarian refugee
movement.

Functions and Service Delivery of
Non-Government Organisations for

Immigrants in Australia

Rosario Lampugnani

Abstract

This paper evaluates the functions and
service delivery of NGOs for immi-
grants in Australia . It argues that the
radical economic restructuring in
Western nations has been characterised

by massive processes of deinsti-
tutionalisation and decentralisation,

with an associated move towards priva-

tisation and the targeting of disadvan-

taged groups. This has led to a
significant reliance on the voluntary
sector to assist in the provision of settle-

ment services for immigrant groups. As

result in most immigrant receiving na-

tions the use of NGOs as an extension of
the state is common.

Précis

Cet article procède à une évaluation des

fonctions et des services assurées par les

ONG ciblant les immigrants en Aus-
tralie. Il développe une argumentation
selon laquelle les restructurations éco-
nomiques radicales des nations occiden-

tales se sont caractérisées par une
progression massive de la désinsti -
tutionalisation et de la décentralisation

des services, auxquels s'associent à la
fois les privatisations et un ciblage plus

net des groupes défavorisés. Cette con-

joncture a entraîné un accroissement
significatif de la tendance à miser sur le

volontariat dans la mise en place de ser-

vices visant à l'intégration des groupes
d'immigrants. Conséquemment, dans
la majorité des nations receveuses d'im-

migrants, le recours aux ONG comme à
une véritable extension de l'état est un

phénomène de plus en plus courant.

Rosario Lampugnani, PhD, is with the Migration

Internal Review Office, Department of
Immigration and Multicultural Affairs,
Melbourne, Australia.

The views expressed in this paper are those of the
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Theories of NGOs

Croft and Beresford (1992) indicate
that beyond the immediate economic
concerns, theories of NGOs should
take into account ideas like the nature

of participation and involvement of
different sections of the population in
relation to social policy. In a society in
which immigration is a major govern-
ment-sponsored policy and practice,
the relationship of immigrant sections
of the population (especially those of
non-English-speaking background) to
NGOs and to their participation and
involvement in mainstream society is
particularly salient.

NGOs tackle problems which may
be looked at by governments or maybe
ignored by them. They provide wel-
fare services to immigrant groups
which are often marginal to main-
stream society, disadvantaged and
disenfranchised. These immigrant
groups experience deprivation of re-
sources, lack of access to the channels

of communication and they have low
levels of skill in negotiating with peo-
ple and organisations in the dominant
society such that they are unlikely to
obtain entry to mainstream services.

Functions of NGOs

NGOs are a "natural/' "spontaneous
social phenomenon" which "act, or
react, to certain types of action under-
taken by institutions with the purpose
of improving the overall or global
quality of the functioning of these in-
stitutions" (Moles 1983, 3; Unikoski
1978; Radecki 1979; Lampugnani
1993). At the same time, these NGOs
have been set up to fill a gap in service
delivery.

Cox (1991) suggests that NGOs'
functions are to provide immigrants
with information, material assistance,
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